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For PC.Efica EFICA, founded in 1996, is an industrial enterprise
employing about 600 people and located in Kimballton, New York.

The company produces concrete systems, steel products and
components, and fiberglass and rubber components. History Pete

Bartlett, Ed.D., founded EFICA with the vision of improving
employee life by developing the company's first workplace. On

November 28, 1996, EFICA was incorporated in the State of New
York. EFICA became known as one of the original employee-owned
companies in the United States, with ownership passing from the

original founder and president, Dr. Bartlett, to the current
generation of employees. The company's first goal, established in

1995, was to build a successful family-run business that would
satisfy corporate and community needs and expectations. The

business' first product was the first commercial integrated concrete
lock system available, and its first achievement was receiving a

patent for its concrete formlock system. In 2006, EFICA developed
the "Powered by the People" sustainability plan that led to the

purchase of energy-efficient equipment and a high tech production
line. In 2007 EFICA received an award for Employee Recruitment.
The company is active in the Local 38 United Electrical, Radio and

Machine Workers of America union. Chronology 1996 May -
FOUNDED: EFICA, a leader in the concrete forms industry, is

founded as a family-owned company in Kimballton, New York, to
produce integrated concrete lock systems. The operation develops
a proprietary process to lock a concrete form after it has hardened,

enabling an efficient and consistent removal of formwork from a
structure. 2005 June - First commercial lock system for concrete,

invented and patented. 2007 June - EFICA receives the "Best
Employer in America" honor in the "Human Resources" category.
2008 June - EFICA receives the "Best Employer in America" honor
for five consecutive years. 2009 September - EFICA receives the
"Best Employer in America" honors in the "Human Resources"
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category. 2010 October - EFICA receives the " 6d1f23a050
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